
Powernet Y & S Technologies Riverside Technologies Adorama Inc ACA Computer Integrator Imperium Data Networks vTECHio
Basic Desktop DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC NO BID $51,561.28 $42,220.80 $48,930.80
Engineering Desktop DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC NO BID $18,237.18 $16,937.06 $14,520.52
Laptop $9,670.00 $5,213.50 DOES NOT MEET SPEC NO BID $7,378.68 $7,630.45 $5,856.46
Tablet NO BID DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC NO BID DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC
Monitor 24" DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC $24,077.41 $21,483.52 $19,946.88
Monitor 27" DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC $4,845.81 $4,715.60 $4,378.30
24-Port PoE+ Switch $28,960.00 $26,207.36 $66,401.78 $27,779.68 $29,321.63 $23,559.52 $63,811.20
24-Port Non-PoE Switch $4,518.00 $4,065.81 $5,126.22 $4,192.95 $4,561.94 $3,655.05 $7,975.68
Network Attached Storage DOES NOT MEET SPEC DOES NOT MEET SPEC $10,471.60 DOES NOT MEET SPEC $8,808.04 $8,714.07 $13,587.92
Main Server $28,394.00 DOES NOT MEET SPEC $22,086.92 NO BID $28,488.90 $21,829.19 DOES NOT MEET SPEC
Secondary Server $51,226.00 DOES NOT MEET SPEC $35,853.16 NO BID $70,030.42 $33,047.72 $42,391.90
Main Router $7,968.00 $3,770.00 $8,776.00 $4,154.00 $4,568.17 $8,108.68 $8,442.70
Secondary  Router $2,640.00 $2,520.00 $3,292.00 $1,572.66 $2,725.58 $3,202.44 $3,232.24

$182,428.21
$201,618.73

Total all Green (lowest bid) fields:
Total all Yellow (next lowest bid) fields:
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